

CJA 20 APPOINTMENT OF AND AUTHORITY TO PAY COURT APPOINTED COUNSEL

1. CIR./DIST./DIV. CODE FLN	2. PERSON REPRESENTED PATTERSON, ARTHUR	VOUCHER NUMBER			
3. MAG. DKT./DEF. NUMBER	4. DIST. DKT./DEF. NUMBER 1:03-000056-002	5. APPEALS DKT./DEF. NUMBER	6. OTHER DKT. NUMBER		
7. IN CASE/MATTER OF (Case Name) U.S. v. PATTERSON	8. PAYMENT CATEGORY Felony	9. TYPE PERSON REPRESENTED Adult Defendant	10. REPRESENTATION TYPE (See Instructions) Criminal Case		

11. OFFENSE(S) CHARGED (Cite U.S. Code, Title & Section) If more than one offense, list (up to five) major offenses charged, according to severity of offense  
 1) 21 841A=CD.F -- CONTROLLED SUBSTANCE - SELL, DISTRIBUTE, OR DISPENSE

12. ATTORNEY'S NAME (First Name, M.I., Last Name, including any suffix) AND MAILING ADDRESS Fletcher, W. Charles Blackstone Building 233 East Bay Street Suite 1020 Jacksonville FL 32202  Telephone Number: (904) 598-0900	13. COURT ORDER <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> O Appointing Counsel <input type="checkbox"/> F Subs For Federal Defender <input type="checkbox"/> P Subs For Panel Attorney <input type="checkbox"/> C Co-Counsel <input type="checkbox"/> R Subs For Retained Attorney <input type="checkbox"/> Y Standby Counsel Prior Attorney's Name: _____ Appointment Date: _____ <input type="checkbox"/> Because the above named person represented has testified under oath or has otherwise satisfied this court that he or she (1) is financially unable to employ counsel and (2) does not wish to waive counsel, and because the interests of justice so require the attorney whose name appears in Item 12 is appointed to represent this person in this case. <input type="checkbox"/> Other (See Instructions) Signature of Presiding Judicial Officer or By Order of the Court: <u>[Signature]</u> Date of Order: 11/04/2008 Nunc Pro Tunc Date: _____ Repayment or partial repayment ordered from the person represented for this service at time of appointment: <input type="checkbox"/> YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO
14. NAME AND MAILING ADDRESS OF LAW FIRM (only provide per instructions) Selinger and Fletcher, PA Blackstone Building 233 East Bay Street Suite 1020 Jacksonville FL 32202	

CLAIM FOR SERVICES AND EXPENSES		FOR COURT USE ONLY			
CATEGORIES (Attach itemization of services with dates)	HOURS CLAIMED	TOTAL AMOUNT CLAIMED	MATH/TECH ADJUSTED HOURS	MATH/TECH ADJUSTED AMOUNT	ADDITIONAL REVIEW
15. COURT	a. Arraignment and/or Plea	1.3			
	b. Bail and Detention Hearings	.1			
	c. Motion Hearings				
	d. Trial				
	e. Sentencing Hearings	.6			
	f. Revocation Hearings				
	g. Appeals Court				
	h. Other (Specify on additional sheets)				
(Rate per hour = \$ 90 )	TOTALS:	2.0	180		
16. OUT OF COURT	a. Interviews and Conferences	2.6			
	b. Obtaining and reviewing records	3.7			
	c. Legal research and brief writing	11.7			
	d. Travel time	23.4			
	e. Investigative and Other work (Specify on additional sheets)	1.1			
(Rate per hour = \$ 90 )	TOTALS:	5931.00			
17. Travel Expenses (lodging, parking, meals, mileage, etc.)		367.20			
18. Other Expenses (other than expert, transcripts, etc.)					
GRAND TOTALS CLAIMED AND APPROVED		6478.20			

19. CERTIFICATION OF ATTORNEY/PAYEE FOR THE PERIOD OF SERVICE FROM 11-3-03 TO 1-6-05	20. APPOINTMENT TERMINATION DATE IF OTHER THAN CASE COMPLETION 1-6-05	21. CASE DISPOSITION Satisfied
---	--	-----------------------------------

22. CLAIM STATUS  Final Payment  Interim Payment Number \_\_\_\_\_  Supplemental Payment  
 Have you previously applied to the court for compensation and/or reimbursement for this case?  YES  NO If yes, were you paid?  YES  NO  
 Other than from the court, have you, or to your knowledge has anyone else, received payment (compensation or anything of value) from any other source in connection with this representation?  YES  NO If yes, give details on additional sheets.  
 I swear or affirm the truth or correctness of the above statements.  
 Signature of Attorney: [Signature] Date: 2-8-05

23. IN COURT COMP.	24. OUT OF COURT COMP.	25. TRAVEL EXPENSES	26. OTHER EXPENSES	27. TOTAL AMT. APPR / CERT
28. SIGNATURE OF THE PRESIDING JUDICIAL OFFICER			DATE	28a. JUDGE / MAG JUDGE CODE
29. IN COURT COMP.	30. OUT OF COURT COMP.	31. TRAVEL EXPENSES	32. OTHER EXPENSES	33. TOTAL AMT. APPROVED
34. SIGNATURE OF CHIEF JUDGE, COURT OF APPEALS (OR DELEGATE) approved in excess of the statutory threshold amount			DATE	34a. JUDGE CODE

05 JAN -5 PM 3:47  
 CLERK OF DISTRICT COURT  
 JACKSONVILLE, FLA.

FILED

308

**IN COURT HOURLY WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	ARRAIGNMENT AND/OR PLEA	MOTIONS AND REQUESTS	BAIL HEARINGS	SENTENCE HEARINGS	TRIAL	REVOCACTION HEARINGS	APPEALS COURT	OTHER
11/04/03	Attend arraignment and detention Hearings.	.4		.1					
12/30/03	Attend arraignment on superseding Indictment.	.3							
1/07/04	Attend change of plea hearing.	.6							
1/06/05	Attend sentencing hearing.				.6				
	Page Total	1.3		.1	.6				
	Grand Total	1.3		.1	.6				

**OUT OF COURT HOURLY WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	INTERVIEWS A CONFERENCE	OBTAINING AND REVIEWING RECOR	LEGAL RESEARCH AND BRIEF WRITING	TRAVEL TIME	INVESTIGATIVE/ OTHER WORK
11/03/03	T. conf. with Pam at Fed Defenders Office in G'ville, receive and review fax of indictment, t. conf. with ausa Williams re facts of case, meet with client in the Alachua County jail and discuss arraignment and detention hearing. T. conf. with client's wife re tomorrow's hearing.	2.3			2.6	
11/04/03	Meet with pre-trial services officer prior to court, review pretrial services report, discuss with client's wife, discuss case with DEA agent Brooks and FDLE agent Lynch. Confer with ausa and client re cooperation to date and attend arraignment and detention hearing.	1.2			2.6	
11/06/03	Review guidelines section on career offender for definition of "two felony convictions," research on westlaw cases from each circuit dealing with career offender sentencing. Print out and review cases in order to discuss possible sentence in case with client.			4.3		
11/07/03	T. conf. with ausa re client's cooperation, meet with client in Alachua County Jail and discuss cooperation, review each section of guidelines with client and estimate sentence, wife's possible testimony at sentencing hearing.	2.4			2.6	
	Page Total	5.9		4.3	7.8	
	Grand Total					

**OUT OF COURT HOURLY WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	INTERVIEWS A CONFERENCE	OBTAINING AND REVIEWING RECORD	LEGAL RESEARCH AND BRIEF WRITING	TRAVEL TIME	INVESTIGATIVE/ OTHER WORK
11/10/03	T. conf. with client's wife, witness Gwen Patterson, re facts of case re search of house and client's participation to date. Draft memo to file re facts and ownership of cocaine in arcade game. T. conf. with co-defendant's attorney Q. Till re cooperation. T. conf. with assistant US Attorney re status of discovery.	1.3				
11/17/03	Receive and review file reports re drug packaging and weight, reports re firearm, investigative reports from DEA from July 2003 through execution of search warrant/surveillance of co-defendants in September of 2003. T. conf. with client re release on state charges.	.6	2.2			
11/19/03	T. conf. with ausa re gun charges in state case and whether he will file gun charges 922(G) in this case, t. conf. with client re facts re gun found in house, review armed career offender guidelines and chapters 18 usc922 and 924 for necessary qualifications. Review fax from court re date for status conference and t. conf. with clerk of court Blair Patton re same. Review drug quantity tables and equivalencies tables to determine total base offense level for cocaine and crack possession.	.5	.2	1.3		
11/25/03	T. conf. with client, t. conf. with ausa re plea agreement, t. status conf. with court re plea date.	.8				
	Page Total	3.2	2.4	1.3		
	Grand Total					

**OUT OF COURT HOURLY WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	INTERVIEWS & CONFERENCE	OBTAINING AND REVIEWING RECOR	LEGAL RESEARCH AND BRIEF WRITTING	TRAVEL TIME	INVESTIGATIVE/ OTHER WORK
12/01/03	T. conf. with client and client's wife re arranging a meeting with me to review police reports. T. conf. with Blair with Judge's office re change of plea. Fax and mail letter to ausa re plea agreement and factual basis.	1.1				
12/02/03	T. conf. with client re meeting date to review police reports and plea agreement.	.4				
12/16/03	T. conf. with client re what he has been doing to help the ausa.	.4				
12/19/03	Receive and review superseding indictment, compare dates with previous indictment.		2			
12/23/03	T. conf. with ausa Williams re plea agreement.	.3				
	Page Total	2.2	.2			
	Grand Total					

**OUT OF COURT HOURLY WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	INTERVIEWS & CONFERENCE	OBTAINING AND REVIEWING RECORD	LEGAL RESEARCH AND BRIEF WRITING	TRAVEL TIME	INVESTIGATIVE/ OTHER WORK
12/29/03	T. conf. with client re information / enhancement, t. conf. with Mr. Patton(Deputy Clerk) re motion to continue. Draft letter to B. Patton re continuance, fax to Patton with copy of Motion to Continue. T. conf. with attorney Till re co-defendant's case and whether he got same enhancement. T. conf. with Deputy Clerk Patton, T. conf. with client re court tomorrow and arraignment on superseding indictment.	1.4				
12/30/03	Meet with client and aUSA prior to arraignment, discuss information/enhancement filed in case, attend arraignment on superseding indictment, discuss case with client after court.	1.2			2.6	
12/31/03	T. conf. with client from Gainesville re police information in police reports.	.3				
1/06/04	T. conf. with client re tomorrow's plea hearing.	.4				
1/7/04	Meet with client in Gainesville in courthouse, review guidelines and operation of 3553 e, discuss case and review plea agreement and factual basis, attend court and enter plea, return to fax.	1.5			2.6	
	Page Total	4.8			5.2	
	Grand Total					

**OUT OF COURT HOURLY WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	INTERVIEWS A CONFERENCE	OBTAINING AND REVIEWING RECOF	LEGAL RESEARCH AND BRIEF WRITTING	TRAVEL TIME	INVESTIGATIVE/ OTHER WORK
1/27/04	T. conf. with client re cooperation.	.3				
2/17/04	Drive to Gainesville for meeting with client and probation officer Emery, meeting canceled by probation officer upon my arrival.				2.6	
3/28/04	Receive and review pre-sentence report, t. conf. with client re quantities in report.	.3	.9			
4/8/04	T. conf. with client re cooperation to date, confer with client's wife re her cooperation.	.5				
4/11/04	Meet with client in Gainesville and review pre-sentence report with him, discuss his substantial assistance with dea, return to Jacksonville.	1.9			2.6	
4/12/04	Draft and send letter to probation re objections to pre-sentence report.					.8
4/18/04	Receive and review updated/amended pre-sentence investigation Report, t. conf. with client re report.	.6	.2			
	Page Total	3.6	1.1		5.2	.8
	Grand Total					

**OUT OF COURT HOURLY WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	INTERVIEWS & CONFERENCE	OBTAINING AND REVIEWING RECORD	LEGAL RESEARCH AND BRIEF WRITING	TRAVEL TIME	INVESTIGATIVE/ OTHER WORK
5/03/04	T. conf. with ausa re request for continuance of sentencing hearing, t. conf. with Debi Boone at US Court re faxing a motion to continue, draft motion, t. conf. with client re motion and status of case, fax motion to ausa and to Boone.	.4		.3		.3
5/05/04	T. conf. with client re sentencing hearing being continued to continue cooperation.	.4				
5/21/04	T. conf. with client re additional cooperation with dea.	.3				
6/30/04	T. conf. with client and ausa re cooperation and new sentencing date.	.6				
7/12/04	T. conf. with client re sentencing hearing, status of cooperation with dea.	.4				
7/14/04	T. conf. with ausa re continuance, draft motion to continue and fax to Blair Patton, T. conf. with judge and ausa re continuance.	.6				
	Page Total	2.7		.3		.3
	Grand Total					



**OUT OF COURT HOURLY WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	INTERVIEWS A CONFERENCE	OBTAINING AND REVIEWING RECORD	LEGAL RESEARCH AND BRIEF WRITTING	TRAVEL TIME	INVESTIGATIVE/ OTHER WORK
7/15/04	T. conf. with client re continuation of sentencing hearing and need to discuss possible impact of new caselaw.	.3				
7/21/04	Research and Review Supreme court case Blakely and cases citing it since June 24, 2004 re relevant conduct findings by probation officer. Print out and review cases re effect of Blakely on relevant conduct. Recalculate guidelines without co-defendant's statements re cocaine amounts that are used to enhance client's sentence. T. conf. with client re whether he wants to contest application of enhancement re amount of drugs as in the Croxford case. Draft short memo to file re same.	.4		3.8		
9/15/04	Research on westlaw decisions of other circuits and the Reese case in 11 <sup>th</sup> circuit re possible Blakely objections. Print-out and review in preparation for meeting with client.			1.1		
9/22/04	Meet with client in Gainesville and discuss meaning of Blakely and other cases cited by it and reason we should not make objections in light of client's cooperation.	.9			2.6	
	Page Total	1.6		4.9		2.6
	Grand Total					

OUT OF COURT HOURLY WORKSHEET

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	INTERVIEWS & CONFERENCES	OBTAINING AND REVIEWING RECORD	LEGAL RESEARCH AND BRIEF WRITING	TRAVEL TIME	INVESTIGATIVE/ OTHER WORK
1/04/05	T. conf. with ausa re sentencing, t. conf. with client re sentencing.	.4				
1/05/05	T. conf. with client re sentencing hearing. Research caselaw on westlaw re any changes to rulings related to Blakely case. T. conf. with ausa re sentencing issues and content of 5k1 motion.	.7		.9		
1/06/05	T. conf. with client in Gainesville re case, travel to Gainesville, review government's 5k1 motion with client before court, attend sentencing hearing, return to Jacksonville.	.9			2.6	
	Page Total	2.0		.9	2.6	1.1
	Grand Total	2.6	3.7	11.7	23.4	2.1

**OTHER EXPENSE WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	EXPLANATION	MILEAGE	PARKING	MEALS	LODGING	COPYING	POSTAGE	TELEPHONE CALLS	TELEGRAMS	OTHER
11/03/03	Travel to Gainesville to meet with client in Alachua jail.	136								
11/04/03	Travel to Gainesville to Attend arraignment and Detention hearings.	136								
11/07/03	Travel to Gainesville to meet with client in Alachua jail.	136								
12/30/03	Travel to Gainesville to Attend arraignment on superseding indictment.	136								
	Page Total	544								
	Grand Total									

**OTHER EXPENSE WORKSHEET**

Case Number: 1:03-CR-56-MM-P  
 Vendor Number: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE	EXPLANATION	MILEAGE	PARKING	MEALS	LODGING	COPYING	POSTAGE	TELEPHONE CALLS	TELEGRAMS	OTHER
1/7/04	Travel to Gainesville to attend change of plea.	136								
2/17/04	Travel to Gainesville to meet with probation and client.	136								
4/11/04	Travel to Gainesville to meet with client.	136								
9/22/04	Travel to Gainesville to meet with client.	136								
1/06/05	Travel to Gainesville to Attend sentencing hearing.	136								
	Page Total	680								
	Grand Total	1224								

1224  
 30 ← 12/11/04  
 367.20